
ELPAR SP Z O.O.

ELPAR Cable Factory has been a leading
producer of a wide range of cables and
conductors since 1989. In addition to the
cables and wires used in power distribution,
Elpar company offers:   signal,
telecommunications, control, mining,
automotive, halogen-free as well as
installation cables. Elpar company products
represent high quality confirmed by the
results of tests conducted in well-known
research laboratories in Poland and abroad.
The company is constantly expanding its
product range through a wide range of sales
and the modernization of the machine park.
Elpar Cables Factory operates on the
international markets in: Lithuania, Slovakia,
Estonia, the Czech Republic, Latvia, Hungary,
Ukraine and Sweden. The company has
received numerous awards and distinctions
and has a quality management system that
complies with the requirements of ISO
9001:2008. Elpar company focuses on
meeting customers’ needs and expectations.
Elpar is open to all kinds of cooperation.

Products & Services: Offered
products/services: telecommunications,
signal, control, mining, automotive, halogen-
free, installation cables.
Website: http://www.elpar.pl [1]

Country: Poland
Place: Parczew, ul.
Laskowa 1
+48 83 355 03 38
+48 83 355 18 88
info@elpar.pl

http://www.elpar.pl


Sector: Maszyny, urządzenia, elektryka i automatyka
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